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China Electric Power Press title: Power Electronics Technology Q
& A List Price: 14.00 yuan Author: Yu Kui editor Press: China
Electric Power Press Publication Date :2004-9 -1ISBN:
9787508322117 Words: 187.000 yards: 264 Edition: 1 Binding:
Paperback: Weight: Editor's Summary book books for
electricians. electrical technicians. and engineering technicians
standing for the power electronics technology in practical
applications prepared by the various problems. The time of
writing. keep it simple and clear. easy to understand. The book
includes seven sections: power electronics technology based on
controlled rectifier circuits. power electronic devices drive.
inverter with variable frequency circuit. the chopper and
exchange regulator. household appliances practical circuit.
transformer design. lists a total of 171 to a problem. the book
Appendix lists the KC series integrated thyristor trigger.
integrated trigger components and commonly used power
electronic devices technical data. etc. to facilitate the reader in
the practical application of inspection. The book is available for
the majority of maintenance electricians. electrical technicians
and engineers and technicians; also available to colleges.
teachers and students of...
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the way the article writer compose this ebook.
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